Agenda Home

BUCKLEY CITY COUNCIL MEETING AGENDA
March 14, 2017
Multi-Purpose Center, 811 Main Street
City Council Meeting
Opening 7:00 P.M.

Call to Order Next Ordinance #04-17
Pledge of Allegiance Next Resolution #17-03

Roll Call of Council Members Next Agenda Bill #AB17-014
A. Citizen Participation

Time Limit of Three Minutes (Must sign up at City Hall by Wednesday prior to the Council Meeting)

B. Staff Reports

C. Main Agenda

1. Presentation & Proclamation: PC Library — Pierce County Reads Program Pg. 8
2. ORD No. -17: Adopting New BMC 3.64 — Small & Attractive Asset Policy Pg. 10
3. ORD No. -17 - Amending BMC 16.24 - City Fire Code Pg. 15
4. Engineering Services Proposal — WWTP Non-Potable Water System Project Pg. 28
D. Consent Agenda Pg. 35

5. A. Approve Minutes of February 28, 2017 City Council Meeting
Approve Minutes of March 7, 2017 City Council Study Session
B. Claims
C. Transfer Voucher
D. Payroll

E. Committee Reports

. Mayor’s Report Johnson

. Administration, Finance & Public Safety Boyle Barrett
. Transportation & Utilities Tremblay

. Community Services Rose

6
7
8
9
10. Council Member Comments & Good of the Order

Council may add and take action on other items not listed on this agenda

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 1



Agenda Home

CITY OF BUCKLEY # PO BOX 1960 # BUCKLEY, WA 98321
360-829-1921 + Fax 360-829-2659 # http://www.cityofbuckley.com

Mar 13
Mar 14
Mar 16
Mar 20
Mar 21
Mar 21

Mar 28

Apr 3
Apr 4
Apr 4
Apr 10
Apr 11
Apr 18
Apr 18
Apr 20

Apr 25

CITY OF BUCKLEY MEETING LIST

10:30 AM

7:00 PM

6:30 PM

7:00 PM

9:30 AM

7:00 PM

7:00 PM

7:00 PM

9:30 AM

7:00 PM

10:30 AM

7:00 PM

9:30 AM

7:00 PM

6:30 PM

7:00 PM

Buckley Hall Board (City Hall)

City Council

Community Services

Planning Commission

Admin, Finance & Public Safety (City Hall)
Transportation & Utilities (City Hall)

City Council

Planning Commission

Admin, Finance & Public Safety (City Hall)
City Council Study Session

Buckley Hall Board

City Council

Admin, Finance & Public Safety (City Hall)
Transportation & Utilities (City Hall)
Community Services

City Council

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017

Page 2



March 2017

aWwoH epuaby

Sun Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat
1 2 3 4
5 6 7 9:30 Admin, Fin | 8 9 10 11
7 Planning Commis- & PS
sion—Public Hearing
7 City Council Study
Session
12 13 14 15 16 17 18
SPRING 10:30 Buckley Hall 7 City Council 6_:30 Community Ser-
Board vices
FORWARD
19 20 21 9:30 Admin, Fin | 22 23 24 25
& PS
7 Planning Commis-
sion 7 Transportation &
Utilities
26 27 28 29 30 31
7 City Council
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 3




BWoH epuab

Sun Mon Tue Wed Thu Fri Sat
1
2 3 4 9:30 Admin,Fin& | 5 6 7 8
PS
7 Planning Commis- | 7 City Council Study
sion Session
9 10 11 12 13 14 15
10:30 Buckley Hall 7 City Council
Board
16 17 18 9:30 Admin, Fin 19 20 21 22
& PS
7 Transportation & 6:30 Community Ser-
Utilities vices
23 24 25 26 27 28 29
7 City Council
30
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 4




Agenda Home

A. CITIZEN PARTICIPATION

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017



Agenda Home

B. STAFF REPORTS

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 6



Agenda Home

C. MAIN AGENDA

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 7



Agenda Home

CITY COUNCIL City of Buckley
0X
AGENDA BILL Buckley, WA 98321

ITEM INFORMATION

Agenda Date: March 14,2017  AB17-014

SUBJECT: Presentation & Department/Committee/Individual Created | Reviewed

Proclamation: Pierce County Library Mayor Pat Johnson X

— Pierce County Reads Program City Administrator — Dave Schmidt X
City Attorney — Phil Olbrechts X
City Engineer — Dominic Miller
City Clerk — Joanne Starr X

Finance Dept — Sheila Bazzar

Building Official — Mike Deadmond

Fire Dept — Chief Predmore

Cost Impact: N/A Parks & Rec Dept — Ellen Boyd
Fund Source: N/A Planning Dept — Kathy Thompson
Timeline: N/A Police Dept — Chief Arsanto

Municipal Court — Jessica Cash

PW/Utilities — Chris Banks

Attachments: None

SUMMARY STATEMENT: Annual presentation and proclamation with Pierce County Library — Pierce
County Reads Program.

COMMITTEE REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION: None

RECOMMENDED ACTION: None

RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION

Meeting Date Action Vote

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 8




Agenda Home

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 9



Agenda Home

CITY COUNCIL City of Buckley
0X
AGENDA BILL Buckley, WA 98321

ITEM INFORMATION

Agenda Date:  March 14, 2017 AB17-015

SUBJECT: ORD No. __-17 - Adopting Department/Committee/Individual Created | Reviewed

New BMC 3.64 — Small & Attractive Mayor Pat Johnson

Asset Policy City Administrator — Dave Schmidt X

City Attorney — Phil Olbrechts

City Engineer — Dominic Miller

XXX XX

City Clerk — Joanne Starr

Finance Dept — Sheila Bazzar

Building Official — Mike Deadmond X
Fire Dept — Chief Predmore X
Cost Impact: N/A Parks & Rec Dept — Ellen Boyd
Fund Source: N/A Planning Dept — Kathy Thompson X
Timeline: N/A Police Dept — Chief Arsanto X

Municipal Court — Jessica Cash

Attachments: Ordinance

SUMMARY STATEMENT: State policy requires that agencies develop written internal policies for
managing small and attractive assets. During the recent State Audit of the City’s finance and
accounting it was identified that the City did not have a formal policy for managing small and
attractive assets and as a result the State Auditor made recommendations that the City develop and
adopt policies for managing these assets.

The ordinance being presented for consideration is a policy satisfying this requirement.

COMMITTEE REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION: A/F/PS 2/21/17

RECOMMENDED ACTION: MOTION to Approve Ordinance No. _ -17 Adopting
a New BMC 3.64 — Small & Attractive Asset Policy.

RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION

Meeting Date Action Vote

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 10




Agenda Home

CITY OF BUCKLEY, WASHINGTON
ORDINANCE NO. _ -17

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
BUCKLEY, PIERCE COUNTY, WASHINGTON, CREATING A
NEW CHAPTER BMC 3.64 ENTITLED SMALL AND
ATTRACTIVE ITEMS POLICIES AND PROCEDURES.

WHEREAS, State policy requires that agencies develop written internal policies
for managing small and attractive assets; and

WHEREAS, State Administrative & Accounting Manual (SAAM) Section
30.40.20 defines small and attractive assets as those falling below the state’s
capitalization level of $5,000 that are particularly vulnerable to loss. Agencies must
consider Weapons, Firearms, Signal Guns, and Accessories (commodity class major
group code 10) as small and attractive assets. Otherwise, agencies have some discretion
in defining small and attractive assets.

WHEREAS, during the recent State Audit of the City’s finance and accounting it
was identified that the City did not have a formal policy for managing small and
attractive assets; and

WHEREAS, as a result the State Auditor made recommendations that the City
develop and adopt policies for managing these assets; and

WHEREAS, based on example policies provided to the City by the Auditor, City
staff drafted new policies and procedures for managing small and attractive assets for
City Council consideration; and

WHEREAS, the City’s Admin/Finance & Public Safety Committee reviewed the
draft policies on February 21, 2017 and recommended that the City Council adopt the
new policies and procedures; and

WHEREAS, the City Council concurs with the Committee’s recommendation
and desires to adopt the new Chapter 3.64 of the Buckley Municipal Code to further
manage small and attractive assets as defined in the chapter;

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 11



Agenda Home

NOW THEREFORE THE CITY OF BUCKLEY, PIERCE COUNTY, DOES
ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. A new Chapter 3.64 entitled “Small and Attractive Items Policies
and Procedures” is hereby created to read as follows:

3.64.010 Policy.

It is the policy of the City to maintain accountability over all tangible items that may have
the likelihood of disappearing without being noticed. The departments shall maintain
records to be verified by a physical inventory at least once a year and provide such list to
the City Clerk for monitoring differences between years.

3.64.020 Purpose.

A small and attractive items system gathers information allowing investigation of items
missing that would otherwise not be noticed. The system should provide adequate
stewardship over its resources through control and accountability.

(1) General. Small and attractive items are defined as easily moveable, desirable items
with a unit cost of $500.00 to $4,999.99 and have a life expectancy of more than one
year. This consists of items that are either concealable or portable and are also not likely
to be missed immediately upon disappearance.

(2) Responsibility of Department Heads. Each department head or their designee will
prepare a list at least annually of their small and attractive items. This list will be
provided to the City Clerk by January 31st each year for monitoring. If an item is deleted,
the department head will note the reason and/or means of disposal.

(3) Asset Identification. The list will contain the serial number, model, or other
identifying information. Whenever feasible, each piece of property will be engraved or
marked with the City’s name. Such markings will be removed or obliterated only when
the item is sold, scrapped, cannibalized, or otherwise disposed of.

(4) Small and Attractive Assets Defined. Small and attractive assets are not to include
more permanent fixtures such as desks, tables and shelving, or items that are equipment
for the purpose of accomplishing tasks that are very small in nature or of minimal
monetary value, like minor equipment, shovels, wrenches, hand tools, staplers and the
like. In addition, small and attractive assets never include items that are consumed or
used up, such as asphalt, bottled water, printer paper, and the like. Small and attractive
assets also do not include items that while they may meet the threshold when purchased
are used as an accessory for a larger capital asset such vehicle accessories like light bars,
cages, sirens, etc. Small and attractive assets should include communications equipment,
optical devices (binoculars, telescopes, range finders, infrared viewers), cameras and
photographic equipment, microcomputer systems, laptop and notebook computers, data-
processing accessory equipment and components (scanners, data displays, etc.), stereos,

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 12



Agenda Home

radios, television sets, tape recorders, DVD players, VCRs, video cameras, weapons and
shop equipment (power tools, scaffolding, ladders, etc.).

3.64.030 Procedures.

(1) Additions. The City may acquire property via purchase, construction, donation, or
lease. Regardless of how it is acquired, when the property is received, the purchasing
department/fund will add it to their small and attractive database listing and mark the
item with the City’s name (these items should be coded as object code 35 according to
the BARS manual.)

(2) Deletions. Items previously acquired will eventually depreciate in value and/or be
disposed of and need to be deleted from the department’s list. Deletion may be required
due to depreciation in value of an asset to below the tracking threshold, a sale of the
asset, scrapping, mysterious disappearance (lost or stolen), or involuntary conversion
(fire, flood, etc.). The department head controlling the item is the only one in position to
trigger removal from their list. Items disappearing mysteriously may require additional
reports to the Police Department, Mayor, and Insurance Company. Deletions brought
about as a result of natural disasters would require reporting to the insurance provider for
an eventual reimbursement claim.

(3) Transfers. Occasional transfers of property between departments, individuals within a
department or funds will occur. The original controlling department/fund is accountable
for all items and for initiating a notice of transfer. Interdepartmental transfers involving a
proprietary fund (i.e., water/sewer) need to have a transfer of money. The sale price will
be fair market value, which may result in a gain or a loss on sale of fixed assets.
Interdepartmental transfers or intergovernmental (i.e., City to County or State) do not
require the City to declare the item surplus or to do a public notice.

(4) Lost or Stolen Assets. Whenever an item has mysteriously disappeared and all efforts
have failed to recover it, the controlling department /fund shall notify the City Clerk via
memorandum, who will give a copy to the City Administrator and Mayor, file a police
report and report to the insurance if necessary, and update the database accordingly.

(5) Donated Assets. Assets are sometimes donated to the City and should be added to the
list of small and attractive assets if valued under $5,000. If the donation is cash to be used
in conjunction with the construction of a specific asset, the donation is reported as
revenue (367 contribution and donations from private sources) in governmental funds; in
proprietary funds, such donations are treated as contributed capital.

Section 2. This ordinance or a summary thereof consisting of the title shall be
published in the official newspaper of the City, and shall take effect and be in full force
five (5) days after publication.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 13



Agenda Home

Section 3. If any provision of this ordinance is held invalid, such invalidity shall
not affect any other provision, or the applications thereof, which can be given effect
without the invalid provision or application, and to this end the provisions of this
ordinance are to be declared severable.

Introduced, passed, and approved this 14™ day of March, 2017.

Mayor Pat Johnson
Attest:

Joanne Starr, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Phil Olbrechts, City Attorney
PUBLISHED:

EFFECTIVE:

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 14



Agenda Home

CITY COUNCIL

City of Buckley

PO Box 1960
AGENDA BILL Buckley, WA 98321

ITEM INFORMATION

Agenda Date:  March 14, 2017 AB17-016

SUBJECT: ORD No. __-17 - Amending Department/Committee/Individual Created | Reviewed
BMC 16.24 City Fire Code Mayor Pat Johnson X

City Administrator — Dave Schmidt X X

City Attorney — Phil Olbrechts X

City Engineer — Dominic Miller

City Clerk — Joanne Starr X

Finance Dept — Sheila Bazzar

Building Official — Mike Deadmond

Fire Dept — Chief Predmore X
Cost Impact: N/A Parks & Rec Dept — Ellen Boyd
Fund Source: N/A Planning Dept — Kathy Thompson X
Timeline: N/A Police Dept — Chief Arsanto

Municipal Court — Jessica Cash

Attachments: Ordinance

SUMMARY STATEMENT: The City is required to update the City Fire Code in BMC 16.24 to be
consistent with RCW 19.27 effective July 1, 2016. The ordinance being presented for consideration

identifies and updates all changes needed to comply with State law.

COMMITTEE REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION: None

RECOMMENDED ACTION: MOTION to Approve Ordinance No. _ -17 Amending

BMC 16.24 City Fire Code.

RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION

Meeting Date Action Vote

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017

Page 15




Agenda Home

ORDINANCE NO. _ -17

AN ORDINANCE of the City Council of the City of Buckley, Pierce
County, Washington, amending Chapters 16.24 of the Buckley
Municipal Code entitled “Fire Code” to be consistent with the
Washington State Building Code Act which went into effect on July
1, 201402016 and replacing the Board of Appeals with the Hearing
Examiner and fixing a date when the same shall become effective.

WHEREAS, certain existing Chapters of Title 16, Buildings and Construction, of
the Buckley Municipal Code will not conform to RCW 19.27, Washington State Building
Code Act, after July 1, 20402016; and

WHEREAS, the City Council must update the provisions relating to BMC 16.24
the City Fire Code to be consistent with RCW 19.27 effective July 1, 20402016; and

WHEREAS, the SEPA Responsible Official determined that adoption of this
ordinance is categorically exempt as a procedural action under WAC 197-11-800(20);
and

WHEREAS, a SEPA determination of non-significance (DNS) was issued by the
Responsible Official on February 2, 2017 pursuant to BMC 12.04 and WAC 197-11-259.
Comment period for the DNS expired on March 8, 2017; and

WHEREAS, the Department of Commerce received the amendment ordinance
on February 2, 2017, under material identification number (MID#) 23359; and

WHEREAS, the city was granted expedited review for on February 21, 2017: and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to amend Chapters 16.24 of the Buckley
Municipal Code to comply with RCW 19.27; now, therefore,

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF BUCKLEY, PIERCE COUNTY, WASHINGTON,
DOES HEREBY ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Chapter 16.24 of the Buckley Municipal Code entitled “Fire Code” is hereby
amended as follows:

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 16



Agenda Home

Chapter 16.24
FIRE CODE

16.24.010 Adoption of International Fire Code.
| The 2009-2015 Edition of the International Fire Code, published by the International
Code Council, including those standards of the National Fire Protection Association
specifically referenced in the International Fire Code, and as amended by the
Washington Administrative Code Chapter 51-54, and as subsequently amended by this
| Chapter, is hereby adopted along with Appendices B, C, D, E-F, and G.

Whenever the following words appear in the International Fire Code, they are to be
changed as follows:

=

“Chief of the Fire Department”, “Fire Prevention Engineer”, “Enforcement
Official”, “Fire Code Official” to “Fire Chief".

2. “Name of Jurisdiction” or “Jurisdiction” to “City of Buckley”.

3. “Corporate Counsel” to “City Attorney”.

4. “Fire Department” to “City of Buckley Fire Department”.

16.24.015 General.
Section 103.1 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

Section 103.1 General. The department of fire prevention, also known as the
Fire Marshal, is established within the jurisdiction under the direction of the Fire
Chief. The function of this department shall be the implementation,
administration and enforcement of the provisions of this Code.

16.24.020 Appointment.
Section 103.2 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

Section 103.2 Appointment. The Fire Chief shall be appointed by the Mayor.

16.24.025 Permits Required.
Section 105.6 of the International Fire Code is amended as follows:

A. 105.6.15-16 Fire Hydrants and valves is deleted.
B. 105.6.35-37 Private Fire Hydrants is deleted.

16.24.030 Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment.
| Section 105.7.5-6 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

| Section 105.7.5-6 Fire alarm and detection systems and related equipment. A
construction permit is required for installation of or modification to fire alarm and
detections systems and related equipment. Maintenance performed in
accordance with this code is not considered a modification and does not require
a permit.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 17



Agenda Home

EXCEPTION: Household fire alarm and detection system equipment installed in
Group R-3 occupancies.

16.24.035 Permit Fees.
Section 105.8 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:

1. Construction Permits. Fees for construction permits for new construction,
including but not limited to tenant improvements, shall be based on the
number of hours spent by the Fire Chief, or their designee, performing the
plan review and fire code inspection. A per hour fee, established by a
Resolution of the City Council, shall be assessed in 30-minute increments
with the first 30 minutes or any portion thereof charged the full hourly rate.

a. Revocation. The Fire Chief is authorized to suspend or revoke a
permit when it is determined that the permittee failed, refused or
neglected to pay required fees within 30 days following mailing of an
invoice to the permitee requiring payment. Mailing shall be
accomplished by first class mail of the U.S. Postal Service.

16.24.040 Board of Appeals.

Section 108 of the International Fire Code is-deleted-in-its-entirety-and-replaced-by-BMC
Chostor 550,
is hereby repealed. Permit decisions made by the Fire Chief, or their designee shall be

subject to the review and appeal process outlined in Chapter 20.01 BMC. Formal Fire
Code interpretations made by the Fire Chief shall be considered a Type Al decision
under Chapter 20.01 BMC for purposes of appeal rights and responsibilities.

16.24.045 Violation — Penalties.
Section 109.3 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

109.3 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate any provision of this code or
shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect, install,
alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or
direction of the fire chief, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this
code, shall be deemed in violation of this title and subject to penalties under the
provisions of BMC 16.70 unless otherwise stated herein.

16.24.050 Unsafe Buildings.
Section 110.5 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:

Section 110.5 Damaged buildings. The owner, occupant or other person having
under their control any property or materials on a property damaged by a fire or
explosion shall, when ordered by the Fire Chief, immediately secure the property
against entry or unauthorized access by the public, by boarding up all openings,
fencing, barricading or utilizing other appropriate measures.

16.24.055 Failure to Comply.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 18



Agenda Home

Section 111.4 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

Section 111.4 Failure to comply. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as the person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition shall be guilty of a
civil infraction as specified in BMC 16.24.045.

16.24.060 Definitions.
Section 502.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to add the following:

FIRE APPARATUS. Fire apparatus is a vehicle such as a fire pumper, aerial
ladder truck, fire tender, elevated platform, rescue squad, fire ground support
vehicle or similar fire-fighting or reserve equipment, including emergency medical
response vehicles.

16.24.065 Fire apparatus access roads - Dimensions.
Section 503.2.1 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads serving one dwelling unit shall
have an unobstructed width of not less than 15 feet, exclusive of shoulders. All
other fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less
than 20 feet, exclusive of shoulders. All fire apparatus access road shall have an
unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches. When a fire
apparatus access road is required, it shall extend from the public or private road
or shared access facility to within 150 feet of all portions of an exterior wall of the
first story, as measured in an approved route around the exterior of the building.

16.24.070 Fire department access roads — Turning radius.
Section 503.2.4 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

503.2.4 Turning radius. The required turning radius of a fire apparatus access
road shall be not less than 28 feet inside, and not less than 48 feet outside
radius.

16.24.075 Fire department access roads — Grade.
Section 503.2.7 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

503.2.7 Grade. The road grade of a fire apparatus access road shall not exceed
12% with a minimum side slope of 2%. All sections of fire apparatus access
roads with grades of over 10% shall be paved.

Exception: Side slope may be less than 2% as required or approved by the City
Engineer.

16.24.080 Fire department access roads - Fire Lanes.
Section 511 is added to the International Fire Code to read as follows:

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 19



Agenda Home

Section 511.1 Establishment of Fire Lanes. Fire lanes in conformance with this
code shall be established by the fire chief or his/her authorized designee, and
shall be referred to as designated fire lanes in this section.

Section 511.2 Definition of Fire Lanes. The area within any public right-of-way,
easement, or on private property designated for the purpose of permitting fire
apparatus use, travel upon, and parking.

Section 511.3 Marking of Fire Lanes. All designated fire lanes shall be clearly
marked by signage and/or surface painting as required by the fire chief. Painted
identification shall be by a four-inch wide line and block letters two feet high,
painted in the lane in bright yellow or bright red, at 50-foot or such other intervals
as determined by the fire chief, stating “Emergency Vehicles Only,” and by
posting of signs stating “Emergency Vehicles Only — No Parking — Violator
Vehicles Subject to Impound.” Signs shall be posted on or immediately next to
the curb line, or on the building. Signs shall be 12 inches by 18 inches and shall
have red letters on a white background, readily readable from at least a 50-foot
distance. Signs shall be posted no further than 50 feet apart, unless a greater
distance is deemed reasonable by the fire chief, nor shall they be more than four
feet from the ground unless a greater height is determined necessary by the fire
chief.

Section 511.4 Obstruction of Fire Lanes Prohibited. The obstruction of a
designated fire lane by a parked vehicle or any other object is prohibited and
shall constitute a traffic hazard as defined in state law and an immediate hazard
to life and property.

Section 511.5 Maintenance of Fire Lanes. Fire lane markings shall be
maintained at the expense of the property owner as often as needed to clearly
identify the designated areas as being a fire lane.

Section 511.6 Property Owner Responsible. The owner, manager, or person in
charge of any property upon which designated fire lanes have been established
shall prevent the parking of vehicles or placement of other obstructions in such
fire lanes.

Section 511.7 Violation — Civil Infraction. Any person who fails to mark or
maintain the markings of a designated fire lane as prescribed in this chapter, or
who parks a vehicle in, allows the parking of a vehicle in, obstructs, or allows the
obstruction of a designated fire lane commits a civil infraction. The penalty for
failing to mark or maintain the markings of a designated fire lane shall be
$150.00. The penalty for parking a vehicle in, allowing the parking of a vehicle in,
obstructing, or allowing the obstruction of a designated fire lane shall be $50.00.

Section 511.8 Impoundment. Any vehicle or object obstructing a designated fire
lane is hereby declared a traffic hazard and may be abated without prior
notification to its owner by impoundment pursuant to the applicable state law.

Section 511.9 Enforcement. The City of Buckley Police Department or any other

designated representative of the fire chief shall have authority to enforce the
provisions of this code.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 20



Agenda Home

16.24.085 Fire protection systems — Records.
Section 901.6.2 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

901.6.2 Records. Records of all system inspections, testing and maintenance
required by the referenced standards shall be maintained on the premises for a
minimum of 3 years. A copy of any inspection, test or maintenance shall be
forward to the Fire Chief within 30 days of the service.

16.24.090 Automatic Sprinkler Systems - Group A-1.
Section 903.2.1.1 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-1 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet;

2. The building has an occupant load of 300 or more;

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge
serving such occupancies.

4. The building contains a multi-theater complex.

16.24.095 Automatic Sprinkler Systems - Group A-3.
Section 903.2.1.3 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.3 Group A-3. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-3 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet;

2. The building has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge
serving such occupancies.

16.24.100 Automatic Sprinkler Systems - Group A-4.
Section 903.2.1.4 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided for Group
A-4 occupancies where one of the following conditions exists:

1. The building exceeds 5,000 square feet;

2. The building has an occupant load of 300 or more.

3. The fire area is located on a floor other than a level of exit discharge
serving such occupancies.

16.24.105 Automatic Sprinkler Systems - Group B ambulatory health care
facilities.
Section 903.2.2 of the International Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

Section 903.2.2 Group B ambulatory health care facilities. An automatic sprinkler

system shall be provided for Group B ambulatory health care facility occupancies
where one of the following conditions exists:

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 21



Agenda Home

The building exceeds 5,000 square feet;

Four or more care recipients are incapable of self-preservation;
One or more care recipients who are incapable of self-preservation
are located at other than the level of exit discharge serving such an
occupancy.

wN e

16.24.110 Automatic Sprinkler Systems - Group R
Section 903.2.8 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with
Section 903.3 shall be provided for Group R occupancies.

Exception: An automatic sprinkler system is not required in Group R-3
occupancies where the total living space of the building does not exceed
5,000 square feet.

16.24.115 Fire Department Connections - Location.
Section 912.2 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

912.2 Location. With respect to hydrants, driveways, buildings and landscaping,
fire department connections shall be so located that fire apparatus and hose
connected to supply the system will not obstruct access to the buildings for other
fire apparatus. The location of the fire department connection shall be approved
by the Fire Chief and shall not be closer than 50 feet from a structure or 1 %
times the height of the structure.

16.24.120 Tire rebuilding and tire storage — Outdoor Storage
Section 2505-3405 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced
as follows:

A. Whenever outside storage of more than 300 tires exists on a property, the
following requirements shall apply:

1. Each pile of tires shall not be greater than 10 feet in height.

2. Piles of tires shall not be within 50 feet of a property line or right-of-way,
or within 50 feet of a building or structure.

3. Piles of tires shall not be in excess of 40 feet in any horizontal dimension.

4. There shall be a minimum separation of 40 feet between piles of tires and
such separation shall be maintained free of rubbish, equipment, weeds or
other vegetation, and other materials at all times.

5. There shall be a fence at least 6 feet in height surrounding the tire
storage yard provided with gates at least 20 feet wide. Gates shall be
kept clear of obstructions, be fully operable at all times, and shall be
locked when the tire storage yard is not staffed. The fence shall be
constructed of a material and in such a way as to obstruct view of the tire
storage yard.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 22



Agenda Home

B. Whenever outside storage of more than 2,500 tires exists on a property, the
following requirements in addition to those set forth in subsection A shall

apply:

1. A dirt berm or barrier not less than 5 feet in height shall be erected
around each pile of tires.

2. The separation between piles of tires shall be a minimum of 40 feet to
include 10 feet at the base of each dirt berm or barrier plus 20 feet
between dirt berms or barriers.

3. Tire storage shall not exceed 30,000 tires per acre.

4. Fire apparatus access roads shall be provided to within 150 feet of all
portions of the tire storage yard.

5. Fire flow shall be provided at not less than 1,500 gpm for a duration of 2
hours.

6. The number of fire hydrants and their location shall be determined by the
fire chief.

B. Cleanup following a fire. If any dangerous, hazardous, or extremely
hazardous wastes occur, or are stored, on the site of a tire storage yard, due
to the results of a fire in such yard, or due to any other occurrence, such
wastes shall be disposed of and cleaned up in accordance with all applicable
Federal, State, and Local waste disposal regulations. No further tire storage
may occur until the appropriate agency has certified that proper disposal has
occurred.

16.24.125 Tire rebuilding and tire storage — Fire Department Access
Section 2506-3406 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety.

16.24.130 Tire rebuilding and tire storage — Fencing

Section 2567-3407 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety.
16.24.135 Tire rebuilding and tire storage — Fire Protection
Section 25068-3408 of the International Fire Code is amended as follows:

A. 2508:13408.1 Water Supply is deleted.
16.24.140 Appendices adopted.

2009-2015 IFC Appendix B, Fire-Flow Requirements for Buildings is amended as
follows:

Section B105 of the International Fire Code is deleted in its entirety and replaced as
follows:

B105 Fire-Flow requirements for buildings. Prior to the issuance of a building
permit for any building, portion of a building, or substantial alteration thereto, fire-
flow shall be provided in the amount required by this Section. Fire-flow shall be
automatically available and supplied at a residual pressure of not less than 20
pounds per square inch (psi) (138 kPa).

B105.1 One- and Two-family dwellings. The minimum fire-flow requirements for
one- and two-family dwellings (Group R-3) having a fire-flow calculation area

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 23



Agenda Home

which does not exceed 3,600 square feet shall be 750 gallons per minute (GPM)
for one (1) hour for each hydrant providing fire flow. Fire-flow for buildings of
3,600 square feet or more in floor area including attached garages, covered
porches and under upper story decks shall be 1,000 GPM for one (1) hour for
each hydrant providing fire flow.

EXCEPTIONS:

i) Fire-protection credits as described in Table B105.2 may be used in
lieu of providing minimum fire-flow requirements for one- and two-
family dwellings (Group R-3) on lots which are one gross acre or more
in area.

b) Fire-protection credits as described in Table B105.2 may be used in
lieu of providing minimum fire-flow requirements for one- and two-
family dwellings (Group R-3) if a water main capable of providing at
least 500 GPM of fire-flow is not available to the building, portion of a
building, or substantial alteration thereto. If the above fire-flow can be
provided by the addition of a fire hydrant, the fire hydrant shall be
installed.

c) When at least 500 GPM is available from an approved fire hydrant, it
shall be credited toward the required fire-flow for one- and two-family
dwellings (Group R-3). The additional fire-flow requirements may be
provided by using fire-protection credits as described in Table B105.2
in lieu of providing additional fire flow.

B105.2 Group U Occupancies. The minimum fire-flow requirements for Group U
occupancies shall be 750 GPM for one (1) hour for each hydrant providing fire
flow.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. Minimum fire-flow is not required for Group U occupancies meeting all
of the following criteria:

a) It does not exceed 2,500 square feet; and

b) Itis accessory to a one- or two-family dwelling (Group R-3) that
has fire-flow or 100% of fire protection credits as described in
Table B105.2; and

c) It has setbacks from side and rear lot lines of at least 20 feet, and
is at least 10 feet from other buildings on the same lot.

2. Fire-protection credits as described in Table 105.2 may be used in
lieu of providing minimum fire-flow requirements for Group U
occupancies on lots which are one gross acre or more in area.

3. Fire-protection credits as described in Table B105.2 may be used in
lieu of providing minimum fire-flow requirements for Group U
occupancies if a water main capable of providing at least 500 GPM of
fire-flow is not available to the building, portion of a building, or
substantial alteration thereto. If the above fire-flow can be provided by
the addition of a fire hydrant, the fire hydrant shall be installed.

4. When at least 500 GPM is available from an approved fire hydrant, it
shall be credited toward the required fire-flow for Group U
occupancies. The additional fire-flow requirements may be provided
by using fire-protection credits as described in Table B105.2 in lieu of
providing additional fire flow.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 24



Agenda Home

B105.3 Buildings other than One- and Two-family dwellings (Group R-3) and
Group U occupancies. The minimum fire-flow requirements for buildings other
than one- and two-family dwellings (Group R-3) and Group U occupancies shall
not be less than that specified in Table B105.1 of the International Fire Code
(IFC).

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A reduction in required fire-flow of up to 50%, as approved, is allowed
when the building is provided with an approved automatic sprinkler
system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2 of
the IFC. Where buildings are also of Type | or Il construction and are
a light-hazard occupancy as defined by NFPA 13, the reduction may
be up to 75%. However, the minimum amount of fire-flow required
shall at no time be less than 1,500 GPM except as noted in Exception
number 2 below. Fire-flow and duration of fire-flow shall be the fire-
flow and duration of the actual fire-flow required after reductions for
fire protection features described above.

2. When at least 1,000 GPM is available from an existing approved
water main, or is provided by the extension of or from an existing
water main, it shall be credited toward the required fire-flow. The fire-
flow requirement may be reduced to that available by using fire-
protection features such as approved monitored automatic sprinkler
systems or fire resistive building construction as specified in Table
B105.2 in lieu of additional fire-flow. Fire-flow and duration of fire-flow
shall be the fire-flow and duration of the actual fire-flow required after
reductions for fire protection features described above.

3. Non-combustible fueling station canopies shall be exempt from all fire
flow provisions.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 25



Agenda Home

TABLE B105.2
Fire Protection Credits @

Group R-3& U ® | All Others ®® 0

Options to reduce Fire-Flow @ % of reduction | % of reduction
Building less than 2,000 sq. ft. -35% -25%
Building 2,000 sq. ft. to 3,600 sq. ft. -20% n/a
NFPA 13D exter(let)jed coverage -65% n/a
sprinkler system
NFPA 13 D sprinkler system -50% n/a
NFPA 13 R sprinkler system -50% n/a
Re3|dentlgl Range-top Fire -15% n/a
Suppression System
NFPA 13 sprinkler system n/a -50%
IC?rg)esrr(}gl)nlmum setback from property 2504 -15%
Monitored Fire Alarm -25% -25%
1-hour construction " -15% -25%
Class A or B roof -15% -10%

o fr .
60% brlck/sto_ne exterior or approved -15% -10%
non-combustible exterior

@ Each portion of a building shall be considered as a separate fire area when
separated by one or more four-hour fire walls with no openings and a 30-inch

parapet, constructed in accordance with the International Building Code (IBC).

@ Credits used for or with substantial alterations shall be applied to the entire
structure.

® Types of construction are based upon the IBC.

“ Shall not apply to IBC Group-H Occupancy classifications.

®)In Types IA and IB construction, only the three largest successive floor areas
shall be used.

©) Consists of a 13D sprinkler system with sprinkler coverage extended into the
garage, attic, small bathrooms and closets, and porch coverings.

) Consists of a minimum of “type X" drywall throughout interior for Group R-3
and U occupancies. Other occupancy groups shall meet the requirements for
one-hour construction specified by the IBC.

® The 30 foot setback is from side and rear property lines. Front setbacks may
be allowed by the zoning of the property.

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017

Page 26



Agenda Home

Section 3. If any provision of this ordinance is declared by any court of competent
jurisdiction to be invalid, then such provision shall be null and void and shall be
severable from the remaining provisions of this ordinance, and shall in no way affect the
validity of the other provisions of this ordinance.

Section 4. This ordinance shall take effect and be in force from and after it's passage

and five days following it's publication as required by law. A summary of this Ordinance
may be published in lieu of publishing the ordinance in its entirety.

Passed by the City Council on the day of ,.20302017.

Mayor Pat Johnson

Attest:

Joanne Starr, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM:

Phil Olbrechts, City Attorney

PUBLISHED:
EFFECTIVE:

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 27



Agenda Home

CITY COUNCIL City of Buckley
0X
AGENDA BILL Buckley, WA 98321

ITEM INFORMATION

Agenda Date: March 14,2017  AB17-017

SUBJECT: Engineering Services Department/Committee/Individual Created | Reviewed
Proposal - WWTP Non-Potable Water Mayor Pat Johnson X
System Project City Administrator — Dave Schmidt X
City Attorney — Phil Olbrechts X
City Engineer — Dominic Miller
City Clerk — Joanne Starr X

Finance Dept — Sheila Bazzar

Building Official — Mike Deadmond

Fire Dept — Chief Predmore

Cost Impact: $29,000 Parks & Rec Dept — Ellen Boyd
Fund Source: Fund 405 (Sewer Cap) Planning Dept — Kathy Thompson
Timeline: N/A Police Dept — Chief Arsanto

Municipal Court — Jessica Cash

PW/Utilities — Chris Banks

Attachments: Engineering Proposal

SUMMARY STATEMENT: Mid-year through 2016 the non-potable water system at the wastewater
treatment plant failed when the pressurized bladder tank ruptured due to corrosion. This system is the
primary recirculating system that cleans screens off in the treatment process. The plant supervisor was
able to reconfigure and install a short term, lower pressure, bypass using a small pump; however, this
was not adequate as a long term fix. A full repair of this system was included in the 2017 Budget which
the City Council approved. Total costs for the repair and upgrade was estimated at:

$115,000 - Pumps upgrade

$ 35,000 - Meter and installation using Vault

$ 7,900 - All related plc-HMI programming

$ 30,000 - Engineering to produce plans and specifications
$187,900 Total Project Costs

The scope of work being presented for consideration will allow the City to have plans and specifications
prepared to go out to bid so that the project can be completed.

COMMITTEE REVIEW AND RECOMMENDATION: None

RECOMMENDED ACTION: Motion to APPROVE the Engineering Services
Proposal for the WWTP Non-Potable Water System Project.

RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION

Meeting Date Action Vote

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 28




Agenda Home

Grray & Osborne, Inc.

CONSULTING ENGINEERS

March 3, 2017

Mr. Dave Schmidt

City Administrator

City of Buckley

P.O. Box 1960

Buckley, Washington 98321

SUBJECT: ENGINEERING SERVICES PROPOSAL FOR WWTP NON-POTABLE
WATER SYSTEM PROJECT
CITY OF BUCKLEY, PIERCE COUNTY, WASHINGTON
G&O #17204.00

Dear Mr. Schmidt:

Gray & Osborne has developed this proposal to provide engineering services for the
Wastewater Treatment Plant Non-Potable Water System project. The project includes
improvements to the current system, which has substantially failed.

The attached Exhibit A defines the scope of work for the project. The attached Exhibit B
includes a breakdown of hours and fees for this work. The estimated cost for completing
the scope of work is $29,000.

Thank you for the opportunity to provide this proposal. Should you concur with this
engineering services proposal, please execute the authorization below and return a copy
of this transmittal to me.

Sincerely,
GRAY & OSBORNE, INC.
Dominic J. Miller, P.E.

DJM/hh
Encl.

2102 Carriage Drive SW, Building 1  Olympia, Washington 98502  (360) 292-7481 Fax (360) 292-7517
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 29
@ Printed on recycled paper



Agenda Home

Mr. Dave Schmidt
March 3, 2017
Page 2

CITY OF BUCKLEY —- WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT NON-POTABLE
WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS DESIGN

Gray & Osborne, Inc. is hereby authorized to proceed with the engineering services as
noted herein and under the terms and conditions of our current On-Call Engineering
Services Contract dated September 14, 2011, for a cost not to exceed $29,000 as noted
herein without further written direction and authorization of the City.

Name (Print) Title

Signature Date

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 30



Agenda Home

EXHIBIT A
SCOPE OF WORK

CITY OF BUCKLEY
WASTEWATER TREATMENT PLANT
NON-POTABLE WATER SYSTEM IMPROVEMENTS DESIGN
FEBRUARY 2017

The non-potable water (NPW) system at the City of Buckley WWTP was originally
designed with two constant-speed, multi-stage centrifugal pumps feeding a looped system
with a large pressure tank. The bladder in the pressure tank recently failed, making
operation of the NPW system in its current configuration difficult. In addition, the sump
in which the existing NPW pumps are installed is located downstream of the effluent
flow meter, and therefore, the NPW use at the plant is currently included in the value
being recorded for effluent flow. The City would like to implement improvements to the
existing system to automate it to meet the variable NPW demand at the WWTP and
provide separate metering of the NPW flow stream.

The services to be furnished by Gray & Osborne under this contract include the necessary
engineering tasks for the design of the desired improvements to the NPW system at the
City’s WWTP. The scope of these services will include the installation of new VFDs for
the NPW pumps with line and load reactors in the existing MCC in the UV building. The
use of VFDs for the NPW pumps will necessitate replacing the existing 20-horsepower
motors with new VFD-rated motors and the installation of additional conduit from the
pump motors to the MCC for the motor temperature switches. The improvements will
also include a small-diameter bypass from the common NPW pump discharge header
back into the NPW sump. This line will be equipped with a pressure relief valve that
would be set to open as required to maintain system pressure during low NPW demand
periods. A new pressure transmitter will be installed adjacent to the existing pressure
transmitter for redundancy. We have assumed that the existing conduit pathway used for
the existing pressure transmitter would also accommodate the conductors for the new
pressure transmitter. A new flow meter vault with a magnetic flow meter will be
installed on the NPW discharge line just outside the UV building to provide continuous
NPW flow measurement. The valve vault will be equipped with a sump pump with
integral controls for drainage.

The following scope of work describes the specific tasks associated with engineering
services for the non-potable water system improvements.

G&O #17204.00 _ Page 1 of 3
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 31



Agenda Home

SCOPE OF WORK
Task 1 — Project Management and Quality Assurance/Quality Control (QA/QC)

Provide overall project management of budget and deliverables over the contract period,
including coordinating work with the City Project Manager/City Staff as required,
coordinate tasks for consultant staff, and provide periodic billing invoices as applicable.

Conduct periodic reviews (50 and 90 percent completion levels) of the design documents
(plans, specifications, and cost estimates (PSE)) to check accuracy, completeness, and
conformance with project criteria. Provide this review by both project and non-project
engineers experienced in design of similar project facilities. Document the review
comments and revise the design documents to incorporate these comments. The City will
be invited to participate in the QA/QC meetings

Task 2 — Predesign Memorandum

Prepare a predesign memorandum that will develop and recommend the improvements to
be included in the NPW system improvements design project described in Task 3.

Task 3 — Non-Potable Water System Improvements Design

Design work shall include all necessary civil, mechanical, and electrical design services
required to adequately show and describe all improvements and modifications to the
existing wastewater treatment plant non-potable water system as described above.

This work will include preparation of draft plans, specifications, and cost estimates for
the NPW system improvements to approximately 50 percent (cost estimate and plans
only), 90 percent (cost estimate, plans, and specifications), and 100 percent/final (cost
estimate, plans, and specifications) levels of completion for review by the City.

Task 4 — Bid and Award Services

Prepare final contract documents and assist the City with advertising the project for
public bid and managing the bid process. Provide four full-size hard copies of the plans
and specifications to the City along with a digital copy of the plans and specifications for
the City’s use. Respond to bidders’ questions. Prepare and issue addenda, as required.
Evaluate bids and provide a letter of award recommendation to the City.

G&O #17204.00 Page 2 of 3
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 32



Agenda Home

SCHEDULE

Assuming a project start date in the middle of March 2017, the following project
schedule is proposed:

Submit Predesign Memorandum to City .......cccceiiinniininine Early April 2017

Submit 50 Percent Plans t0 City ......cccocvrvimmnininiiecneienennnns Early May 2017

Submit 90 Percent Plans and Specifications to City ............. End of May 2017

Submit Final PSE to City and Advertise for Bid ................... Middle of June 2017

OPEN Bids......ccoveririirisusarssnsrssssassssssasenssssassssssnsasssassscosssesssnns End of June 2017
BUDGET

The maximum amount payable to the Engineer for completion of work associated with
this scope of work, including contingencies, salaries, overhead, direct non-salary costs,
and net fee is set forth in the attached Exhibit B. This amount will not be exceeded
without prior written authorization of the City.

G&O #17204.00 Page 3 of 3
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 33



BWoH epuab

EXHIBIT B

ENGINEERING SERVICES
SCOPE AND ESTIMATED COST

City of Buckley - Wastewater Treatment Plant Non-Potable Water System Improvements Design

Project Project Civil Electrical AutoCAD
Manager Engineer Engineer Engineer Technician
Tasks Hours Hours Hours Hours Hours
1 Project Management and QA/QC 4 4 2 4
2 Predesign Memorandum 2 4 6 4
3 Non-Potable Water System Improvements Design 4 8 36 72 64
4 Bid and Award Services 2 4 4 2
Hour Estimate 12 20 48 80 66
Estimated Fully Burdened Billing Rate:* $160 $130 $110 $150 $100
Fully Burdened Labor Cost: $1,920 $2,600 $5,280 $12,000 $6,600
Total Fully Burdened Labor Cost: $ 28,400
Direct Non-Salary Cost:
Mileage & Expenses (mileage @ current IRS rate) $ 300
Printing $ 300
TOTAL ESTIMATED COST: $ 29,000

*  Actual labor cost will be based on each employee's actual rate. Estimated rates are for determining total estimated cost only. Fully burdened billing rates
include direct salary cost, overhead, and profit.

G&O #17204.00 Page 1 of 1
City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 34



Agenda Home

D. CONSENT AGENDA

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 35



Agenda Home

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 36



Agenda Home

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 37



Agenda Home

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 38



BWoH epuab

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 39



BWoH epuab

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 40



BWoH epuab

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 41



BWoH epuab

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 42



Agenda Home

E. COMMITTEE REPORTS

City Council Agenda Packet 03-14-2017 Page 43



	AG Packet 3-14-17 (A)
	Meeting List - Mar-Apr 2017
	Calendar - March, 2017
	March 2017


	Calendar - April 2017
	April 2017


	A. CITIZEN PARTICIPATION
	B. STAFF REPORTS
	C. MAIN AGENDA
	Agenda Bill 17-014 (Presentation & Proclamation - Pierce County Library – Pierce County Reads Program)
	RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION
	Meeting Date


	AI #1 - Proclamation - Pierce County Reads
	Agenda Bill 17-015 (ORD No. __-17 - Adopting New BMC 3.64 – Small & Attractive Asset Policy)
	RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION
	Meeting Date


	AI #2 - Ord ___-17 - Adding a New Chapter BMC 3.64 (Small & Attractive Assets Policy)
	3.64.010 Policy.
	3.64.020 Purpose.
	3.64.030 Procedures.

	Agenda Bill 17-016 (ORD No. __-17 - Amending BMC 16.24 City Fire Code)
	RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION
	Meeting Date


	AI #3 - ORD ___- 17 - Amending BMC 16.24 - City Fire Code

	AG Packet 3-14-17 (B)
	Agenda Bill 17-017 (Engineering Services Proposal – WWTP Non-Potable Water System Project)
	RECORD OF COUNCIL ACTION
	Meeting Date


	AI #4 - Engineering Services Proposal - WWTP Non-Potable Water System Project
	D. CONSENT AGENDA
	City Council Minutes 2-28-2017
	City Council Minutes 3-7-2017 (Study Session)
	Transfer Voucher 28 Feb 2017
	E. COMMITTEE REPORTS



<<

  /ASCII85EncodePages false

  /AllowTransparency false

  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true

  /AutoRotatePages /None

  /Binding /Left

  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)

  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)

  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error

  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4

  /CompressObjects /Tags

  /CompressPages true

  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true

  /PassThroughJPEGImages true

  /CreateJobTicket false

  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default

  /DetectBlends true

  /DetectCurves 0.0000

  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK

  /DoThumbnails false

  /EmbedAllFonts true

  /EmbedOpenType false

  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true

  /EmbedJobOptions true

  /DSCReportingLevel 0

  /EmitDSCWarnings false

  /EndPage -1

  /ImageMemory 1048576

  /LockDistillerParams false

  /MaxSubsetPct 100

  /Optimize true

  /OPM 1

  /ParseDSCComments true

  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true

  /PreserveCopyPage true

  /PreserveDICMYKValues true

  /PreserveEPSInfo true

  /PreserveFlatness true

  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false

  /PreserveOPIComments true

  /PreserveOverprintSettings true

  /StartPage 1

  /SubsetFonts true

  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply

  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve

  /UsePrologue false

  /ColorSettingsFile ()

  /AlwaysEmbed [ true

  ]

  /NeverEmbed [ true

  ]

  /AntiAliasColorImages false

  /CropColorImages true

  /ColorImageMinResolution 300

  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleColorImages true

  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /ColorImageResolution 300

  /ColorImageDepth -1

  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1

  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeColorImages true

  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterColorImages true

  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /ColorACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /ColorImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasGrayImages false

  /CropGrayImages true

  /GrayImageMinResolution 300

  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleGrayImages true

  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /GrayImageResolution 300

  /GrayImageDepth -1

  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2

  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeGrayImages true

  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterGrayImages true

  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /GrayACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /GrayImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasMonoImages false

  /CropMonoImages true

  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200

  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleMonoImages true

  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /MonoImageResolution 1200

  /MonoImageDepth -1

  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeMonoImages true

  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode

  /MonoImageDict <<

    /K -1

  >>

  /AllowPSXObjects false

  /CheckCompliance [

    /None

  ]

  /PDFX1aCheck false

  /PDFX3Check false

  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false

  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true

  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true

  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()

  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()

  /PDFXOutputCondition ()

  /PDFXRegistryName ()

  /PDFXTrapped /False



  /CreateJDFFile false

  /Description <<



    /BGR <>

    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>

    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>

    /CZE <>

    /DAN <>

    /DEU <>

    /ESP <>

    /ETI <>

    /FRA <>

    /GRE <>



    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata najpogodnijih za visokokvalitetni ispis prije tiskanja koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)

    /HUN <>

    /ITA <>

    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>

    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>

    /LTH <>

    /LVI <>

    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)

    /NOR <>

    /POL <>

    /PTB <>

    /RUM <>

    /RUS <>

    /SKY <>

    /SLV <>

    /SUO <>

    /SVE <>

    /TUR <>

    /UKR <>

    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)

  >>

  /Namespace [

    (Adobe)

    (Common)

    (1.0)

  ]

  /OtherNamespaces [

    <<

      /AsReaderSpreads false

      /CropImagesToFrames true

      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue

      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false

      /IncludeGuidesGrids false

      /IncludeNonPrinting false

      /IncludeSlug false

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (InDesign)

        (4.0)

      ]

      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false

      /OmitPlacedEPS false

      /OmitPlacedPDF false

      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy

    >>

    <<

      /AddBleedMarks false

      /AddColorBars false

      /AddCropMarks false

      /AddPageInfo false

      /AddRegMarks false

      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK

      /DestinationProfileName ()

      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /Downsample16BitImages true

      /FlattenerPreset <<

        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution

      >>

      /FormElements false

      /GenerateStructure false

      /IncludeBookmarks false

      /IncludeHyperlinks false

      /IncludeInteractive false

      /IncludeLayers false

      /IncludeProfiles false

      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (CreativeSuite)

        (2.0)

      ]

      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /PreserveEditing true

      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged

      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile

      /UseDocumentBleed false

    >>

  ]

>> setdistillerparams

<<

  /HWResolution [2400 2400]

  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]

>> setpagedevice




<<

  /ASCII85EncodePages false

  /AllowTransparency false

  /AutoPositionEPSFiles true

  /AutoRotatePages /None

  /Binding /Left

  /CalGrayProfile (Dot Gain 20%)

  /CalRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CalCMYKProfile (U.S. Web Coated \050SWOP\051 v2)

  /sRGBProfile (sRGB IEC61966-2.1)

  /CannotEmbedFontPolicy /Error

  /CompatibilityLevel 1.4

  /CompressObjects /Tags

  /CompressPages true

  /ConvertImagesToIndexed true

  /PassThroughJPEGImages true

  /CreateJobTicket false

  /DefaultRenderingIntent /Default

  /DetectBlends true

  /DetectCurves 0.0000

  /ColorConversionStrategy /CMYK

  /DoThumbnails false

  /EmbedAllFonts true

  /EmbedOpenType false

  /ParseICCProfilesInComments true

  /EmbedJobOptions true

  /DSCReportingLevel 0

  /EmitDSCWarnings false

  /EndPage -1

  /ImageMemory 1048576

  /LockDistillerParams false

  /MaxSubsetPct 100

  /Optimize true

  /OPM 1

  /ParseDSCComments true

  /ParseDSCCommentsForDocInfo true

  /PreserveCopyPage true

  /PreserveDICMYKValues true

  /PreserveEPSInfo true

  /PreserveFlatness true

  /PreserveHalftoneInfo false

  /PreserveOPIComments true

  /PreserveOverprintSettings true

  /StartPage 1

  /SubsetFonts true

  /TransferFunctionInfo /Apply

  /UCRandBGInfo /Preserve

  /UsePrologue false

  /ColorSettingsFile ()

  /AlwaysEmbed [ true

  ]

  /NeverEmbed [ true

  ]

  /AntiAliasColorImages false

  /CropColorImages true

  /ColorImageMinResolution 300

  /ColorImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleColorImages true

  /ColorImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /ColorImageResolution 300

  /ColorImageDepth -1

  /ColorImageMinDownsampleDepth 1

  /ColorImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeColorImages true

  /ColorImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterColorImages true

  /ColorImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /ColorACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /ColorImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000ColorImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasGrayImages false

  /CropGrayImages true

  /GrayImageMinResolution 300

  /GrayImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleGrayImages true

  /GrayImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /GrayImageResolution 300

  /GrayImageDepth -1

  /GrayImageMinDownsampleDepth 2

  /GrayImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeGrayImages true

  /GrayImageFilter /DCTEncode

  /AutoFilterGrayImages true

  /GrayImageAutoFilterStrategy /JPEG

  /GrayACSImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /GrayImageDict <<

    /QFactor 0.15

    /HSamples [1 1 1 1] /VSamples [1 1 1 1]

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayACSImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /JPEG2000GrayImageDict <<

    /TileWidth 256

    /TileHeight 256

    /Quality 30

  >>

  /AntiAliasMonoImages false

  /CropMonoImages true

  /MonoImageMinResolution 1200

  /MonoImageMinResolutionPolicy /OK

  /DownsampleMonoImages true

  /MonoImageDownsampleType /Bicubic

  /MonoImageResolution 1200

  /MonoImageDepth -1

  /MonoImageDownsampleThreshold 1.50000

  /EncodeMonoImages true

  /MonoImageFilter /CCITTFaxEncode

  /MonoImageDict <<

    /K -1

  >>

  /AllowPSXObjects false

  /CheckCompliance [

    /None

  ]

  /PDFX1aCheck false

  /PDFX3Check false

  /PDFXCompliantPDFOnly false

  /PDFXNoTrimBoxError true

  /PDFXTrimBoxToMediaBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXSetBleedBoxToMediaBox true

  /PDFXBleedBoxToTrimBoxOffset [

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

    0.00000

  ]

  /PDFXOutputIntentProfile ()

  /PDFXOutputConditionIdentifier ()

  /PDFXOutputCondition ()

  /PDFXRegistryName ()

  /PDFXTrapped /False



  /CreateJDFFile false

  /Description <<



    /BGR <>

    /CHS <FEFF4f7f75288fd94e9b8bbe5b9a521b5efa7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065876863900275284e8e9ad88d2891cf76845370524d53705237300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c676562535f00521b5efa768400200050004400460020658768633002>

    /CHT <FEFF4f7f752890194e9b8a2d7f6e5efa7acb7684002000410064006f006200650020005000440046002065874ef69069752865bc9ad854c18cea76845370524d5370523786557406300260a853ef4ee54f7f75280020004100630072006f0062006100740020548c002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee553ca66f49ad87248672c4f86958b555f5df25efa7acb76840020005000440046002065874ef63002>

    /CZE <>

    /DAN <>

    /DEU <>

    /ESP <>

    /ETI <>

    /FRA <>

    /GRE <>



    /HRV (Za stvaranje Adobe PDF dokumenata najpogodnijih za visokokvalitetni ispis prije tiskanja koristite ove postavke.  Stvoreni PDF dokumenti mogu se otvoriti Acrobat i Adobe Reader 5.0 i kasnijim verzijama.)

    /HUN <>

    /ITA <>

    /JPN <FEFF9ad854c18cea306a30d730ea30d730ec30b951fa529b7528002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020658766f8306e4f5c6210306b4f7f75283057307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a30674f5c62103055308c305f0020005000440046002030d530a130a430eb306f3001004100630072006f0062006100740020304a30883073002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e003000204ee5964d3067958b304f30533068304c3067304d307e305930023053306e8a2d5b9a306b306f30d530a930f330c8306e57cb30818fbc307f304c5fc59808306730593002>

    /KOR <FEFFc7740020c124c815c7440020c0acc6a9d558c5ec0020ace0d488c9c80020c2dcd5d80020c778c1c4c5d00020ac00c7a50020c801d569d55c002000410064006f0062006500200050004400460020bb38c11cb97c0020c791c131d569b2c8b2e4002e0020c774b807ac8c0020c791c131b41c00200050004400460020bb38c11cb2940020004100630072006f0062006100740020bc0f002000410064006f00620065002000520065006100640065007200200035002e00300020c774c0c1c5d0c11c0020c5f40020c2180020c788c2b5b2c8b2e4002e>

    /LTH <>

    /LVI <>

    /NLD (Gebruik deze instellingen om Adobe PDF-documenten te maken die zijn geoptimaliseerd voor prepress-afdrukken van hoge kwaliteit. De gemaakte PDF-documenten kunnen worden geopend met Acrobat en Adobe Reader 5.0 en hoger.)

    /NOR <>

    /POL <>

    /PTB <>

    /RUM <>

    /RUS <>

    /SKY <>

    /SLV <>

    /SUO <>

    /SVE <>

    /TUR <>

    /UKR <>

    /ENU (Use these settings to create Adobe PDF documents best suited for high-quality prepress printing.  Created PDF documents can be opened with Acrobat and Adobe Reader 5.0 and later.)

  >>

  /Namespace [

    (Adobe)

    (Common)

    (1.0)

  ]

  /OtherNamespaces [

    <<

      /AsReaderSpreads false

      /CropImagesToFrames true

      /ErrorControl /WarnAndContinue

      /FlattenerIgnoreSpreadOverrides false

      /IncludeGuidesGrids false

      /IncludeNonPrinting false

      /IncludeSlug false

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (InDesign)

        (4.0)

      ]

      /OmitPlacedBitmaps false

      /OmitPlacedEPS false

      /OmitPlacedPDF false

      /SimulateOverprint /Legacy

    >>

    <<

      /AddBleedMarks false

      /AddColorBars false

      /AddCropMarks false

      /AddPageInfo false

      /AddRegMarks false

      /ConvertColors /ConvertToCMYK

      /DestinationProfileName ()

      /DestinationProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /Downsample16BitImages true

      /FlattenerPreset <<

        /PresetSelector /MediumResolution

      >>

      /FormElements false

      /GenerateStructure false

      /IncludeBookmarks false

      /IncludeHyperlinks false

      /IncludeInteractive false

      /IncludeLayers false

      /IncludeProfiles false

      /MultimediaHandling /UseObjectSettings

      /Namespace [

        (Adobe)

        (CreativeSuite)

        (2.0)

      ]

      /PDFXOutputIntentProfileSelector /DocumentCMYK

      /PreserveEditing true

      /UntaggedCMYKHandling /LeaveUntagged

      /UntaggedRGBHandling /UseDocumentProfile

      /UseDocumentBleed false

    >>

  ]

>> setdistillerparams

<<

  /HWResolution [2400 2400]

  /PageSize [612.000 792.000]

>> setpagedevice



	Button1: 


